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– Apart from designing sustainable 
apparel, I led the improvement of all our 
customer-facing content, including a 
website redesign, new instagram 
content, plus a more focused and 
consistent newsletter.
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– After on site research, waiting to board 
revealed to be the most stressful part. 
To counter this stressor, my sketches 
lead to an on-the-go personal isolated 
space. Calming & sensory-friendly 
materials were chosen.
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– Visualizing my ideas for a toy and a 
monitoring device, I imagined fun & 
playful interactions. The mobile app 
focused on creating consistency across 
both mediums. 
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– With a focus on noise and feel, the 
product uses pulses to communicate 
with the user about its environment and 
nearby objects- replacing the need for a 
traditional white cane.



– “eye.” was awarded 3rd place at the LA 
Regional Xingshi Cup 2018, which 
included presenting to future potential 
investors in Guangzhou, China.
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